Design/Build Post Frame Buildings (30°x607)
Bid Opening Tuesday September 1, 2020 at 2:00 P.M.

Dutchman Contracting LLC

Amy D Shirk

(717) 575-9350
amy.dutchmancontracting@gmail.com

Emailed specs 8-4-20

Total Amount Bid Item 1 $214,870.00

Alt 2 $39,372.00
Alt 3 $23,346.00
Alt 4 $65,248.00

Conestoga Construction

C B Structures, Inc.

Susie Whary, Senior Division Coordinator
202 Orlan Road

New Holland, PA 17557

Cell Phone: 717-572-3882

Office Phone: 717-354-2613, Ext. 219
swhary@cbstructuresinc.com

Emailed specs 8-3-20

Total Amount Bid Item 1 $296,784.00

Alt 2 $39,894.00
Alt 3 $23,600.00
Alt 4 $49,512.00

Joseph Porretta Builders
551 Anderson Ave
Hammonton, NJ 08037
609-561-6391
609-567-9398 fax

joe.porrettabuilders@comcast.net

Emailed specs 8-11-20

Total Amount Bid Item 1 $290,834.00

Alt 2 $28,424.00
Alt 3 $17,750.00
Alt 4 $98,864.00

Straga Brothers, Inc.
P.O. Box 216
Glassboro, NJ 08028

Total Amount Bid Item 1 $314,100.00

Alt 2 $47,900.00
Alt 3 $23,200.00
Alt 4 $64,200.00

Pelka Construction

617 Herman Rd

Jackson, NJ 08527

(732) 928-8925
ziggy@pelkaconstruction.com

Emailed specs 7-30-20

Total Amount Bid Item1$ NO BID

Alt2$

Alt3$

Alt4$

Hall Construction Co., Inc.

Esther Gagliano, Assistant to the President
Mark D. Hall, AIC, CPC

PO Box 1448, Wall, NJ 07719

Physical: 1720 Route 34, Wall, NJ 07719
T: 732.938.4255 | F: 732.938.4452
egagliano@hallgc.com

Emailed specs 8-3-20

Total Amount Bid Item1$ NO BID

Alt2$

Alt3$

Alt4$
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Design/Build Post Frame Buildings (30°x607)
Bid Opening Tuesday September 1, 2020 at 2:00 P.M.

MIBO Construction Co Inc.

Patrick Sparks, Sr. Project Manager Total Amount Bid Item1$  NO BID
331 White Horse Pike
Atco, NJ 08004 Alt2$
856-809-1550 (Fax 1552)
sparconinc@verizon.net Alt3$
Alt4$
Emailed specs 8-3-20
Box Research, LLC
Saswati Bose, Procurement Manager Total Amount Bid Item1$ _ NO BID
252 Nassau St
Princeton, NJ 08542 Alt2$
saswatibose9194@outlook.com
Alt3$
Emailed specs 8-3-20 Alt4$
Russo Corporation
Nick Russo Total Amount Bid Item1$ _ NO BID
403 Helms Ave.
Swedesboro, NJ 08085 Alt2$
O: 856.491.9243
C: 856.297.2259 Alt3$
NickR@RussoCorporation.com Alt4$
Emailed specs 8-4-20
MES Consulting Engineers & Surveyor, DPC
Jeffrey Clark / Proposal Manager Total Amount Bid Item 1 $___NO BID
2780 Hamilton Blvd. South Plainfield, NJ 07080
Cell: (609)707-4648 Alt2$
Office: 908-922-4622 / Fax: 866-517-7413 Alt3$
jac@mfsengineers.com
Alt4$
Emailed specs 8-5-20
Dodge Data & Analytics
Elaine Wilson Total Amount Bid Item1$ _ NO BID
4300 Beltway PI, Suite 150
Arlington, TX 76018 Alt2$
T 413.507.0211 | F 609.336.2767 Alt3$
Elaine.Wilson@construction.com
Alt4$
Emailed specs 8-7-20
MJJ Construction LLC
471 White Horse Pike Total Amount Bid Item1$ __ NO BID

Atco, NJ 08004
Phone: Atco 856-768-9440 Fax 856-768-9495
mjjconstruction@mijjconstructionllc.com

Emailed specs 8-11-20

Alt2$

Alt3$

Alt4$
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Design/Build Post Frame Buildings (30°x607)

Bid Opening Tuesday September 1, 2020 at 2:00 P.M.

Pennoni
Kimberley Chianese Total Amount Bid Item1$_ NO BID
515 Grove Street, Suite 1B
Haddon Heights, NJ 08035 Alt2$
Direct: +1 (856) 656-2850 Alt3$
KChianese@Pennoni.com
Emailed specs 8-17-20 Alt4$
Becica Associates, LLC
Total Amount Bid Item1$  NO BID

Lisa May & Steve Becica
500 S Kings Highway
Cherry Hill, NJ 08034
Phone - 856-795-1180
Fax — 856-354-6367

Imayo@BecicaAssociates.com

emailed specs 8-17-20

sabecica@becicaassociates.com

emailed specs 8-18-20

Alt2$

Alt3$

Alt4$



mailto:KChianese@Pennoni.com
mailto:lmayo@BecicaAssociates.com
mailto:sabecica@becicaassociates.com

